
COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT 
BUILDING SAFETY 

7887 E. 60th Ave., Commerce City, CO 80022 Tel: 303-289-3790 Fax: 303-289-3731 www.c3gov.com 

Commerce City Amendments 
to the 

2018 International Fire Code 
The city of Commerce City adopts the 2018 edition of the International Fire Code, including Appendices B, C, D, E, F, H, 
I, J, K, L, M and N, and all standards contained in such code and appendices (the “IFC”), save and except such 
amendments as set forth in this article.  

The 2018 edition of the International Fire Code is amended in the following respects and adopted herein as amended 
(effective date December 4, 2019). 

(a) Section 101.1 is amended to read as follows:  

101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of the city of Commerce City, hereinafter referred to as 
“this code.”  

(b) Section 102.11, entitled “Other Laws,” is amended by addition of the following:  

Whenever any county health department, state, federal, or local law or regulation imposes a greater or more restrictive 
requirement than required by this code, the provisions of those laws or regulations shall govern. Whenever the 
requirements imposed by this code are greater or more restrictive than the requirements imposed by any other law or 
regulation or resolution of any governmental body, then the requirement of this code shall govern.  

(c) Section 103.1, entitled “General,” is amended to read as follows:  

103.1 General. The department of fire prevention is established within the jurisdiction under the direction of the fire code 
official. As used in this code, “department of fire prevention” shall mean the South Adams County Fire Protection District 
or Greater Brighton Fire Protection District, as applicable. The South Adams County Fire Protection District and Greater 
Brighton Fire Protection District are charged with the implementation, administration, and enforcement of the provisions 
of this code.  

(d) New Section 103.1.1, entitled “South Adams County Fire Protection District,” is added to read as follows:  

103.1.1 South Adams County Fire Protection District. For the administration and enforcement of this code within the 
South Adams County Fire Protection District, the terms "chief," "chief of the fire department," "fire marshal," "bureau of 
fire prevention," "fire prevention bureau," "fire prevention engineer," and "fire code official" shall mean "Fire Marshal of 
the South Adams County Fire Protection District, Colorado," except in Section 104.11 where the term "chief" shall mean 
"Chief of the South Adams County Fire Protection District" and the term "fire department" shall mean the "South Adams 
County Fire Protection District. 

(e) New Section 103.1.2, entitled “Greater Brighton Fire Protection District,” is added to read as follows:  

103.1.2 Brighton Fire Rescue District. For the administration and enforcement of this code within the Greater Brighton 
Fire Protection District, the terms "chief," "chief of the fire department," "fire marshal," "bureau of fire prevention," "fire 
prevention bureau," "fire prevention engineer," and "fire code official" shall mean "Fire Marshal of the Greater Brighton 
Fire Protection District," except in Section 104.11 where the term "chief" shall mean "Chief of the Greater Brighton Fire 
Protection District" and the term "fire department" shall mean the "Greater Brighton Fire Protection District."  



Version: 2018.1, Last updated: 12/4/2019 Page 2 of 3 Commerce City Amendments to the IFC 

(f) Section 104.3, entitled “Right of entry,” is hereby deleted in its entirety and the following is added in lieu thereof:  

104.3 Right of entry. The fire code official’s right to enter and inspect property shall be exercised in accordance with 
Section 1-3001 of the Commerce City Revised Municipal Code, as amended from time to time.  

(g) Section 106, entitled “Fees,” is deleted in its entirety and the following is added in lieu thereof:  

SECTION 106 - FEES  

106.1 Payment of fees. The fees for any permit issued pursuant to this code, as well as related fees for work done in 
connection to or concurrently with the work authorized by a permit, shall be set by resolution of the city council. The city 
council is also authorized to establish a refund policy, and to impose additional fees for any person who commences any 
work before obtaining the necessary permits. No permit shall be valid until the appropriate fees have been paid, except 
emergency permits issued pursuant to Section 105.1.4.  

(h) (h) Section 109, entitled “Board of Appeals,” is hereby deleted in its entirety and the following is added in lieu thereof:  

SECTION 109 - APPEALS  

109.1 Board of appeals. In order to hear and decide appeals of orders, decisions or determinations made by the fire code 
official relative to the application and interpretation of this code, there shall be and is hereby created a board of appeals. 
For provisions relating to the board of appeals, see Section 5-21 of the Commerce City Revised Municipal Code.  

(i) Section 110, entitled “Violations,” is deleted in its entirety and the following is added in lieu thereof:  

SECTION 110 – VIOLATIONS  

110.1 Unlawful acts. No person or entity shall violate a provision of this code or fail to comply therewith or with any of 
the requirements thereof. No person or entity shall fail to comply with any order issued by the fire code official under this 
code. No person or entity shall erect, construct, alter, repair, remove, demolish or utilize a building, occupancy, premises 
or system regulated by this code, or cause same to be done, except in conformity with all of the provisions of this code 
and in conformity with the terms and conditions of any permit, certificate, or other approval issued under this code, or of 
any directive of the fire code official.  

110.2 Penalties and enforcement. Violations of this code are subject to enforcement through the penalties, procedures, 
and remedies specified in Article V, Chapter 5 and other applicable provisions of the Commerce City Revised Municipal 
Code, at the discretion of the city.  

(j) Section 112, entitled “Stop Work Order,” is deleted in its entirety and the following is added in lieu thereof:  

SECTION 112 – STOP WORK ORDER  

112.1 General provisions. Where the fire code official finds any work regulated by this code being performed in a 
manner either contrary to the provisions of this code or in a manner that is dangerous or unsafe, the fire code official is 
authorized to issue a stop work order in accordance with the provisions of Section 5-5007 of the Commerce City Revised 
Municipal Code, as may be amended from time to time.  

(k) Section 503.2.1, entitled “Dimensions,” is amended to read as follows:  

SECTION 503 - FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS  

503.2.1 Dimensions. Fire Apparatus Roads shall have an unobstructed width of not less than 24 feet (7,315 mm), 
exclusive of shoulders, except for approved security gates in accordance with Section 503.6, and an unobstructed vertical 
clearance of not less than 13 feet 6 inches (4,115 mm).  



Version: 2018.1, Last updated: 12/4/2019 Page 3 of 3 Commerce City Amendments to the IFC 

(l) Section 507.5.1.2, entitled “Hydrant for automatic sprinkler systems,” is added to read as follows:  

SECTION 507 - FIRE PROTECTION WATER SUPPLIES  

Section 507.5.1.2 Hydrant for automatic sprinkler systems. Buildings equipped with an automatic sprinkler system 
installed in accordance with 903.3.1.1 and 903.3.1.2 shall have a fire hydrant within 150 feet (45,720 mm) of the fire 
department connection.  

Exception: The distance shall be permitted to exceed 150 feet (45,720 mm) where approved by the fire code official.  

(m) Section 903.4.2.1, entitled “Audible and visual,” is added to read as follows:  

SECTION 903 - AUTOMATIC SPRINKLER SYSTEMS  

Section 903.4.2.1 Audible and visual. Approved audible and visual devices shall be installed throughout all buildings 
provided with an automatic sprinkler system  


	to the
	The city of Commerce City adopts the 2018 edition of the International Fire Code, including Appendices B, C, D, E, F, H, I, J, K, L, M and N, and all standards contained in such code and appendices (the “IFC”), save and except such amendments as set f...
	The 2018 edition of the International Fire Code is amended in the following respects and adopted herein as amended (effective date December 4, 2019).

